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Fee (1)
208-222 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-224 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-225 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-226 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-228 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-231 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-236 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-237 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-242 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-245 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-253 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-254 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-255 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-256 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-257 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-258 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-259 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-264 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-265 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-266 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-267 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-268 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-273 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-274 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-276 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-278 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-285 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-286 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-289 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-297 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-325 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-326 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-328 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-335 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

MONTHLY RECURRING CHARGES
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208-337 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-346 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-347 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-349 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-352 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-354 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-355 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-356 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-357 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-363 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-364 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-365 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-366 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-374 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-382 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-394 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-397 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-423 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-425 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-427 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-432 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-435 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-436 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-437 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-438 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-443 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-448 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-452 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-453 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-454 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-456 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-458 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-459 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-462 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
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208-464 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-466 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-476 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-482 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-483 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-486 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-487 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-495 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-525 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-527 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-531 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-532 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-534 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-536 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-537 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-538 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-543 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-547 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-548 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-549 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-554 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-555 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-558 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-562 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-564 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-566 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-570 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-574 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-578 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-584 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-585 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-587 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-588 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-623 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
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208-624 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-628 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-632 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-633 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-634 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-636 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-638 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-642 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-644 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-645 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-646 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-648 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-652 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-653 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-654 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-655 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-657 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-658 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-662 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-663 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-668 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-673 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-674 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-678 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-679 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-682 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-683 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-684 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-686 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-687 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-689 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-698 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-707 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-722 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
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208-727 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-736 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-744 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-745 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-747 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-753 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-754 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-756 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-759 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-764 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-766 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-767 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-768 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-769 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-772 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-774 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-775 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-776 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-777 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-778 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-782 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-784 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-787 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-793 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-796 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-799 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-823 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-824 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-825 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-826 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-832 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-833 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-834 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-835 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
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208-836 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-837 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-838 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-839 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-842 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-843 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-845 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-847 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-852 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-854 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-857 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-858 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-862 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-864 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-865 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-868 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-873 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-875 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-876 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-877 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-878 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-879 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-882 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-885 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-886 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-888 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-894 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-896 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-897 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-922 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-924 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-926 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-934 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-935 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
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208-937 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-939 ISDN  $300.00 *Estimated  taxes, fees & surcharges are in column J. $0.09 n/a n/a $36.35 n/a n/a n/a
208-942 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-945 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-962 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-981 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-983 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Terms and Conditions: 
This quote is valid for 90 days from the issue date. 
This quote pricing is per Voice T1 above assumes on-net network status.  For locations not on tw telecom fiber (off-net) price is $350 Monthly Recurring Cost per Voice T1. 
This quote does not guarantee delivery of Service; Service delivery and installation are subject to determination by TWTC. 
This quote is contingent upon available facilities and/or capacity and is subject to determination by TWTC.
This quote supersedes any previously quoted between the Customer and TWTC with regard to the Service set forth in the Quote. 
This quote includes estimated  Federal Universal Service Fund, ID Universal Service Fund (USF) Surchage, E911 Surcharge, and Telecommunications Service Assistance Program (TSAP)  fees. 
Please, refer to the State of Idaho Terms & Conditions for any termination liability language.
All information herein is confidential and intended solely for the Customer's benefit.  The Customer shall not disclose information contained herein to any other parties.
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Optional Feature 

(1)
Optional Feature 

(2)
208-222 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-224 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-225 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-226 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-228 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-231 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-236 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-237 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-242 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-245 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-253 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-254 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-255 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-256 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-257 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-258 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-259 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-264 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-265 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-266 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-267 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-268 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-273 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-274 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-276 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-278 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-285 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-286 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-289 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-297 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-325 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-326 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-328 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-335 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

OPTIONAL FEATURES NON-RECURRING CHARGES
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NPA-NXX MEL (Market Expansion Line) Name and Number Delivery Other 1 Other 2 Local Loop and/or Trunk Installation Local Loop and/or Trunk Move
Optional Feature 

(1)
Optional Feature 

(2)

OPTIONAL FEATURES NON-RECURRING CHARGES

208-337 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-346 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-347 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-349 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-352 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-354 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-355 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-356 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-357 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-363 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-364 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-365 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-366 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-374 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-382 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-394 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-397 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-423 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-425 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-427 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-432 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-435 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-436 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-437 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-438 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-443 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-448 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-452 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-453 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-454 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-456 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-458 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-459 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-462 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
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NPA-NXX MEL (Market Expansion Line) Name and Number Delivery Other 1 Other 2 Local Loop and/or Trunk Installation Local Loop and/or Trunk Move
Optional Feature 

(1)
Optional Feature 

(2)

OPTIONAL FEATURES NON-RECURRING CHARGES

208-464 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-466 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-476 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-482 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-483 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-486 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-487 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-495 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-525 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-527 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-531 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-532 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-534 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-536 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-537 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-538 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-543 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-547 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-548 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-549 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-554 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-555 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-558 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-562 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-564 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-566 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-570 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-574 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-578 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-584 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-585 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-587 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-588 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-623 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
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NPA-NXX MEL (Market Expansion Line) Name and Number Delivery Other 1 Other 2 Local Loop and/or Trunk Installation Local Loop and/or Trunk Move
Optional Feature 

(1)
Optional Feature 

(2)

OPTIONAL FEATURES NON-RECURRING CHARGES

208-624 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-628 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-632 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-633 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-634 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-636 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-638 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-642 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-644 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-645 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-646 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-648 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-652 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-653 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-654 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-655 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-657 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-658 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-662 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-663 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-668 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-673 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-674 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-678 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-679 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-682 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-683 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-684 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-686 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-687 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-689 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-698 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-707 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-722 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
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NPA-NXX MEL (Market Expansion Line) Name and Number Delivery Other 1 Other 2 Local Loop and/or Trunk Installation Local Loop and/or Trunk Move
Optional Feature 

(1)
Optional Feature 

(2)

OPTIONAL FEATURES NON-RECURRING CHARGES

208-727 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-736 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-744 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-745 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-747 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-753 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-754 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-756 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-759 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-764 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-766 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-767 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-768 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-769 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-772 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-774 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-775 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-776 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-777 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-778 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-782 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-784 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-787 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-793 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-796 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-799 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-823 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-824 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-825 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-826 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-832 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-833 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-834 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-835 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
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NPA-NXX MEL (Market Expansion Line) Name and Number Delivery Other 1 Other 2 Local Loop and/or Trunk Installation Local Loop and/or Trunk Move
Optional Feature 

(1)
Optional Feature 

(2)

OPTIONAL FEATURES NON-RECURRING CHARGES

208-836 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-837 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-838 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-839 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-842 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-843 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-845 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-847 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-852 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-854 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-857 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-858 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-862 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-864 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-865 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-868 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-873 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-875 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-876 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-877 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-878 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-879 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-882 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-885 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-886 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-888 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-894 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-896 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-897 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-922 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-924 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-926 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-934 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-935 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
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NPA-NXX MEL (Market Expansion Line) Name and Number Delivery Other 1 Other 2 Local Loop and/or Trunk Installation Local Loop and/or Trunk Move
Optional Feature 

(1)
Optional Feature 

(2)

OPTIONAL FEATURES NON-RECURRING CHARGES

208-937 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-939 Please refer to Section 5.6.3. for additional features included. n/a Please refer to Appendix 6
208-942 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-945 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-962 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-981 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
208-983 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
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