ATTACHMENT D - PRICE SCHEDULE

Bidder Name: Wilbur-Ellis

Bidder's Authorized Representative:

Kathy Brown

Phone: (208) 509-1570

ADJUVENTS TRADE NAME
Cost of th Cost of th
Item ) Estimated Not to Exceed | Chemical Form os. ° ) € Price per UOM os. ° ) € Price per UOM
Adjuvants Trade Name . . , L. . Container Size(s) Container Size(s) Comment Manufacturer SKU
No. Quantities Container Size Liquid  Solid 10.1.25 2.1.26
10.1.25 2.1.26
1  |Drift Control (Justified or Crosshair) Crosshair 350 2.5 gal v $138.98 $55.59 $138.98 $55.59 Wilbur-Ellis 200639
Blend of Modified Vegetable Oil + Organosilicone . .
2 Syl-tac EA 178.35 71.34 b 71.34 Wilbur-Ell 226524
Surfactant (Syl-Tac, Dyne-amic, Phase) yi-tac 10 2.5 gal v 3 3 RS 3 tour-elis
Blend of Modified Vegetable Oil + Organosilicone
3 |Surfactant with Aquatic Label (Syl-Tac EA, Dyne-amic, Syl-tac EA $178.35 $71.34 $178.35 $71.34 Wilbur-Ellis 226524
Phase) 10 2.5 gal v
4 [Non-lonic Surfactant (Activator 90) Alligare 90 10 2.5 gal v $41.35 $16.54 $41.35 $16.54 Alligare 247175
5 |Non-lonic Surfactant with Aquatic Label (Rainier-EA) Rainier EA 10 25 gal v $92.50 $37.00 $92.50 $37.00 Wilbur-Ellis 226610
Non-lonic Surfactant with Aquatic Label R-11 10 2.5 gal v $77.50 $31.00 $77.50 $31.00 Wilbur-Ellis 118400
6 |Non-lonic Surfactant (Generic 80% or better) Alligare 90 130 2.5 gal v $41.35 $16.54 $41.35 $16.54 Alligare 247175
7 |Aquatic Surfactant (Agri-Dex) 910 2.5 gal v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 |Bareground Surfact + Drift Agent (Grounded) 115 2.5 gal v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 |Bareground Surfact + Drift Agent (Efficax) Efficax 115 2.5 gal v $143.75 $57.50 $143.75 $57.50 Wilbur-Ellis 253027
11 |Spray Colorant (Hi-Light Blue) Hi-Light Blue 155 2.5 gal % $129.40 $51.76 $129.40 $51.76 BASF 105173
12 [Penetrant + Drift Control (Liberate) Alleviate 160 2.5 gal v $114.00 $45.60 $114.00 $45.60 Wilbur-Ellis 281255
13 [Penetrating Surfactant (Hel-Fire) Cynder 40 2.5 gal v $87.50 $35.00 $87.50 $35.00 Wilbur-Ellis 253048
MSO + Non-lonic + UAN Solution with Aquatic Label
14 R de EA 106.25 42.50 106.25 42.50 Wilbur-Elli 226611
(Renegade-EA) enegade 20 2.5 gal v 3 3 3 3 tour-Etis
15 |Drift & Deposition Agent with Aquatic Label (Diligence-EA) [Alleviate 20 2.5 gal v $114.00 $45.60 $114.00 $45.60 Wilbur-Ellis 281255
16 |Antifoam (Defoamer) De-Foamer 68 1qt v $15.30 $15.30 $15.30 $15.30 Alligare 254472
ADJUVENTS GENERIC NAME
Cost of th Cost of th
Item ) ; . Estimated Not to Exceed | Chemical Form os. ° 3 € Price per UOM os. ° 3 € Price per UOM
Generic Manufacturer & Chemical Name Generic Name . . . L . Container Size(s) Container Size(s) Comment Manufacturer SKU
No. Quantities Container Size Liquid  Solid 10.1.25 2.1.26
10.1.25 2.1.26
17 [Drift Control (Justified or Crosshair) Crosshair 350 2.5 gal v $138.98 $55.59 $138.98 $55.59 Wilbur-Ellis 200639
Blend of Modified Vegetable Oil + Organosilicone . .
18 MVO Plus (All 84.08 33.63 84.08 33.63 All 266717
Surfactant (Syl-Tac, Dyne-amic, Phase) us (Alligare) 10 2.5 gal v $ 3 $ 3 lgare
Blend of Modified Vegetable Oil + Organosilicone
19 [Surfactant with Aquatic Label (Syl-Tac EA, Dyne-amic, MVO Plus (Alligare) $84.08 $33.63 $84.08 $33.63 Alligare 266717
Phase) 10 2.5 gal v
20 |Non-lonic Surfactant (Activator 90) Alligare 90 10 2.5 gal v $41.35 $16.54 $41.35 $16.54 Alligare 247175
21 [Non-lonic Surfactant with Aquatic Label (Rainier-EA) Alligare 90 10 2.5 gal v $41.35 $16.54 $41.35 $16.54 Alligare 247175
22 |Non-lonic Surfactant (Generic 80% or better) Alligare 90 130 2.5 gal v $41.35 $16.54 $41.35 $16.54 Alligare 247175
23 |Aquatic Surfactant (Agri-Dex) Super Spread MSO 910 25 gal v $48.75 $19.50 $48.75 $19.50 Wilbur-Ellis 119036
24 |Bareground Surfact + Drift Agent (Grounded) 115 2.5 gal v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 |Bareground Surfact + Drift Agent (Efficax) Efficax 115 2.5 gal v $143.75 $57.50 $143.75 $57.50 Wilbur-Ellis 253027
27 |Spray Colorant (Hi-Light Blue) Super Marking Dye 155 25 gal v $128.78 $51.51 $128.78 $51.51 Alligare 225924




28 |Penetrant + Drift Control (Liberate) Alligare 7 160 2.5 gal v $80.45 $32.18 $80.45 $32.18 Alligare 267152
29 |Penetrating Surfactant (Hel-Fire) Brimstone 40 2.5 gal v $76.50 $30.60 $76.50 $30.60 Wilbur-Ellis 192306

MSO + Non-lonic + UAN Solution with Aquatic Label
30 R de EA 106.25 42.50 106.25 42.50 Wilbur-Elli 226611

(Renegade-EA) enegade 20 2.5 gal v 3 3 3 3 tour-Eiis
31 |[Drift & Deposition Agent with Aquatic Label (Diligence-EA) |Alleviate 20 2.5 gal v $114.00 $45.60 $114.00 $45.60 Wilbur-Ellis 281255
32 |Antifoam (Defoamer, Generic) De-Foamer 68 1qt v $15.30 $15.30 $15.30 $15.30 Alligare 254472

HERBICIDES TRADE NAME
Cost of th Cost of th
Item ) Estimated Not to Exceed | Chemical Form os. ° 3 € Price per UOM os. ° 3 € Price per UOM
Herbicdes Trade Name . . . L . Container Size(s) Container Size(s) Comment Manufacturer SKU
No. Quantities Container Size Liquid  Solid 10.1.25 2.1.26
10.1.25 2.1.26

Glyphosate - 41% A.l.; 59% other i dients (Glyst:
33 yp osate % A5 59% other ingredients (Glystar Glystar Original 60 30 gal Discontinued Tenkoz 191094

original) or equal v
34 |[Diglycolamine (Vanquish, Dicamba HD) or equal Dicamba HD 250 30 gal v $1,142.70 $38.09 $1,142.70 $38.09 Albaugh 240780
35 |Picloram (Tordon 22K) or equal Tordon 22K 30 30 gal v $1,832.40 $61.08 $1,832.40 $61.08 Corteva 104177
36 [2,4-D, Dicamba (Veteran 720) or equal Rangestar 90 30 gal v $652.80 $21.76 $652.80 $21.76 Albaugh 114616
37 |2,4-D Acid (Hardball) or equal 60 30 gal v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
38 [2,4-D Choline (Freelexx) or equal Freelexx 30 30 gal v $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 Min Sell Price Corteva 266069

3-(3,4-dichl henyl)-1, 1-dimethyl Di 4L); 409 . .
39 |3(3dichlorophenyl) imethylurea (Diuron 4L); 40% |, 0 a1 90 30gal $780.00 $26.00 $780.00 $26.00 Alligare 226270

A.l. (60% inert ingredients) or equal v

Discontinued -

Glyphosate - 53.8% A.l.; 46.2% other i dients with
4o [PlYPhOsate ° o other ingredients wi Roundup Custom 100 2.5 gal $78.80 $31.52 $78.80 $31.52 Substitute Bayer 294550

aquatic label (Aquaneat) or equal

v Aquamaster

Glyphosate - 41% A.l plus surfactant Glystar Plus 2.5 gal v $46.23 $18.49 $46.23 $18.49 Albaugh 111052
41 |2,4-D Amine (Weedar 64) or equal 2,4-D Amine 115 2.5 gal v $59.43 $23.77 $59.43 $23.77 Alligare 235744
42 |Triclopyr (Garlon 4 Ultra) or equal Garlon 4 Ultra 20 2.5 gal v $216.35 $86.54 $216.35 $86.54 Corteva 168948
43 |Triclopyr Choline (Vastlan) or equal Vastlan 20 2.5 gal v $262.50 $105.00 $262.50 $105.00 Min Sell Price Corteva 237640
44 |Triclopyr (Garlon 3) or equal Garlon 3A 20 2.5 gal v $129.63 $51.85 $129.63 $51.85 Corteva 103613
45  |Fluroxypyr (Vista XRT) or equal Vista XRT 45 2.5 gal v $333.15 $133.26 $333.15 $133.26 Corteva 185737
46 [2,4-D 39.6% + Picloram 10.2% (Tordon 101) or equal 70 2.5 gal v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Picloram 14.4% (4-amino-3,5,6-trichloro-2-
47 |pyridinecarboxylic acid) + 2,4-D 43.6% (2,4- Graslan L 810 2 gal Discontinued Corteva

dichlorophenoxy acetic acid, choline salt (Graslan) or equal v
48 |Aminopyralid (Milestone) or equal Milestone 268 2.5 gal v $735.00 $294.00 $712.50 $285.00 Min Sell Price Corteva 156479
49 |2,4-D + triclopyr BEE (Crossbow) or equal Crossbow 10 2.5 gal v $105.33 $42.13 $105.33 $42.13 Corteva 169903
50 |Indaziflam (EsplAnade 200 SC) or equal Esplanade 200 SC 20 2.5 gal v $3,772.80 $1,509.12 $3,772.80 $1,509.12 Min Sell Price Environmental Sc|293515

Round ikP

51 |Indaziflam (EsplAnade EZ) or equal S((:)L'Jl'ro]t:lp QuikPro 50 2.5 gal v $244.25 $97.70 $244.25 $97.70 Bayer 280988
52  [Fluroxypyr 1-methylheptyl ester + 2-4,D (TrumpCard) 250 2.5 gal v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dimethylamine Salt 2,4-D + I Dicamba (E2
53 e('qm; ylamine Salt 2,4-D + Fluroxypyr + Dicamba (E2)or | , 265 2.5 gal , $160.13 $64.05 $160.13 $64.05 Min Sell Price Nufarm 192026

u

Imazapyr - 27.7% A.l. (73.3% Other Ingredients) (Polaris) or
54 Py oAl (73.3% & ) ) 30 2.5 gal $179.40 $71.76 $179.40 $71.76 Alligare 233503

equal Ecomazapyr 2SL v
55 |Triclopyr (Trycera) or equal 25 2.5 gal v
56 [Flumioxazin, 44% A.l. (Lock Down SC) or equal Lockdown SC 25 2.5 gal v $832.50 $333.33 $832.50 $333.33 Nufarm 263534
57 |[Aminocycloprachlor (25% A.l.) (Method 240 SL) or equal Method 240SL 30 2.5 gal v $912.00 $364.80 $912.00 $364.80 Min Sell Price Environmental Sc|239198

P lan 0.85% + Oxyfl fen 40.31% (Cl t
58 e:::rsu an B.es% + Uxytiurorten 6 (Cleantraxx)or .\ traxx 20 2.5 gal y $453.75 $181.50 $453.75 $181.50 Min Sell Price Corteva 239965
59 [Sulfentrazone 39.6% A.l. (Portfolio 4F) Portfolio 4F 20 2.5 gal v $687.50 $275.00 $687.50 $275.00 Moved to Passage Alligare 282099
60 [2,4-D 34.2% + Trichlopyr 15.2% (AquaSweep) AquaSweep 20 2.5 gal v $142.88 $57.15 $142.88 $57.15 Min Sell Price Nufarm 208201
61 |Topramezone (Frequency) or equal Frequency 55 1 gal v $679.00 $679.00 $679.00 $679.00 BASF 190538
62 [Imazapic (Plateau) or equal Plateau 10 1 gal v $140.00 $140.00 $140.00 $140.00 BASF 107681

We are out. Substitute.



63

Sulfometuron/Chlorsulfuron (Landmark XP) or equal

192

64 oz

Discontinued

Discontinued

Discontinued

Discontinued

v
64 [Pyraflufen 2% (Venue) or equal Venue 20 1qt v $121.98 $121.98 $121.98 $121.98 Nichino 170718
65 |Rimsulfuron (Matrix SG) or equal Laramie 25DF 10,500 16 oz v $72.64 $4.54 $72.64 $4.54 Alligare 239799
66 [Metsulfuron (Escort) or equal Escort XP 160 16 oz v $37.60 $2.35 $37.60 $2.35 Environmental Sc|233152
67 |Chlorosulfuron (Telar XP) or equal Telar XP 416 80z v $111.28 $13.91 $111.28 $13.91 Environmental Sc|240937
68 |Flumioxazin, 51% A.l. (Payload) or equal Payload 120 12 Ib v $439.08 $36.59 $439.08 $36.59 Nufarm 166442
B il-Di 40% B il, 40% Di , 20% oth X .
go |Bromacil-Diuron (40% Bromacil, 40% Diuron, 20% other |, 1 1640 9% 61b v $72.00 $12.00 $72.00 $12.00 Alligare 226768
ingredients) - (Krovar | DF, Bromacil/Diuron 40/40) or equal
| -Di 7.78% | 5 62.22% Di .
70 |Imazapyr-Diuron (7.78% Imazapyr % Diuron) _ 10 5lb v $57.30 $11.46 $57.30 $11.46 Alligare 202367
(Mojave) or equal Mojave
- - 5 B -
71 Zl(;zl:’r;:oxazm, 33.5% A.l., Pyroxasulfone 42.5% A.. (Piper) or Piper 15 3.751b v Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued  [Discontinued Corteva
72 |Dicamba Acid (Vision) or equal 100 2.5 gal v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
HERBICIDES GENERIC
. ) Cost of the . Cost of the .
Item ) ; . Estimated Not to Exceed | Chemical Form A 3 Price per UOM A 3 Price per UOM
Generic Manufacturer & Chemical Name Generic Name . . ) L. . Container Size(s) Container Size(s) Comment Manufacturer SKU
No. Quantities Container Size Liquid  Solid 10.1.25 2.1.26
10.1.25 2.1.26
_ o, . 0, H H
72 GIYPhosate 41% A.l.; 59% other ingredients (Glystar Glystar Original 60 30 gal Discontinued Tenkoz 191094
original) or equal v
73 |Diglycolamine (Vanquish, Dicamba HD) or equal Dicamba HD 250 30 gal v $1,292.40 $38.09 $1,292.40 $38.09 See attached letter |Albaugh 240780
74 |Picloram (Tordon 22K) or equal 30 30 gal v $1,832.40 $61.08 $1,832.40 $61.08 See attached letter [Corteva 104177
75 |2,4-D, Dicamba (Veteran 720) or equal Rangestar 90 30 gal v $652.80 $21.76 $652.80 $21.76 Albaugh 114616
76 |2,4-D Acid (Hardball) or equal 60 30 gal v
77 |2,4-D Choline (Freelexx) or equal Freelexx 30 30 gal v $1,050.00 $35.00 $1,050.00 $35.00 Min Sell Price Corteva 266069
- -di - -di H . 10,
7 |?(34-dichlorophenyl)-1, 1-dimethylurea (Diuron 4L); 40% |, o)) 90 30 gal $780.00 $26.00 $780.00 $26.00 See attached letter  |Alligare 226270
A.l. (60% inert ingredients) or equal v
- 0, . 0, H H 3
79 |Glvphosate - 53.8% Al.; 46.2% other ingredients with AquaNeat 100 2.5 gal $84.70 $33.88 $84.70 $33.88 See attached letter  |Nufarm 105796
aquatic label (Aquaneat) or equal v
80 [2,4-D Amine (Weedar 64) or equal 2,4-D Amine 115 2.5 gal v $59.43 $23.77 $59.43 $23.77 See attached letter  [Alligare 118384
81 [Triclopyr (Garlon 4 Ultra, Element 4) or equal Element 4 20 2.5 gal v $170.50 $68.20 $170.50 $68.20 Corteva 168370
82 [Triclopyr Choline (Vastlan) or equal Vastlan 20 2.5 gal v $262.50 $105.00 $262.50 $105.00 Min Sell Price Corteva 237640
83 |Triclopyr (Garlon 3, Element 3A) or equal Element 3A 20 2.5 gal v Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued |Use Garlon 3A Corteva 171257
84 [Fluroxypyr (Vista XRT) or equal Vista XRT 45 2.5 gal v $333.15 $133.26 $333.15 $133.26 Corteva 185737
85 |2,4-D 39.6% + Picloram 10.2% (Tordon 101) or equal 70 2.5 gal v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Corteva
Picloram 14.4% (4-amino-3,5,6-trichloro-2-
86 |pyridinecarboxylic acid) + 2,4-D 43.6% (2,4- 810 2.5 gal Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued  |Discontinued Corteva
dichlorophenoxy acetic acid, choline salt (Graslan) or equal Graslan L v
290 |Aminopyralid (Milestone) or equal Milestone 268 2.5 gal v $735.00 $294.00 $712.50 $285.00 Min Sell Price Corteva 156479
291 |2,4-D + triclopyr BEE (Crossbow) or equal Crosshow 10 2.5 gal v $105.33 $42.13 $105.33 $42.13 Tenkoz 169903
292 |Indaziflam (EsplAnade 200 SC) or equal Esplanade 200 SC 20 2.5 gal v $3,772.80 $1,509.12 $3,772.80 $1,509.12 Min Sell Price Environmental Sc|293515
293 |Indaziflam (EsplAnade EZ) or equal sg‘;"fulp QuikPro 50 2.5 gal y $244.25 $97.70 $244.25 $97.70 Bayer 280988
ota
294 (Fluroxypyr 1-methylheptyl ester + 2-4,D (TrumpCard) 250 2.5 gal v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
295 D'melthy'am'"e Salt2,4-D + Fluroxypyr + Dicamba (E2)or | , 265 2.5gal y $160.13 $64.05 $160.13 $64.05 Min Sell Price Nufarm 192026
equa
| -27.7% A.l. (73.3% Other | dients) (Polari
206 | MaZAPY! 6 A.l. (73.3% Other Ingredients) (Polaris) or 30 2.5 gal $179.40 $71.76 $179.40 $71.76 Alligare 233503
equal Ecomazapyr 2SL v
297 |Triclopyr (Trycera) or equal 25 2.5 gal v No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
298 |Flumioxazin, 44% A.l. (Lock Down SC) or equal Lockdown SC 25 2.5 gal v $832.50 $333.33 $832.50 $333.33 Nufarm 263534

Out of product. Substitute

See attached letter



Penoxsulan 0.85% + Oxyflurorfen 40.31% (Cleantraxx) or

equal

299 | Cleantraxx 20 2.5 gal v $453.75 $181.50 $451.25 $180.50 Min Sell Price Corteva 239965
equa
300 [Sulfentrazone 39.6% A.l. (Portfolio 4F) Portfolio 4F 20 2.5 gal v $687.50 $275.00 $687.50 $275.00 Moved to Passage Alligare 282099
301 [2,4-D 34.2% + Trichlopyr 15.2% (AquaSweep) AquaSweep 20 2.5 gal v $142.88 $57.15 $142.88 $57.15 Min Sell Price Nufarm 208201
99 |Aminocycloprachlor (25% A.l.) (Method) or equal Method 240SL 30 2.5 gal v $912.00 $364.80 $912.00 $364.80 Min Sell Price Environmental Sc|296781
100 [Topramezone (Frequency) or equal 55 1 gal v $679.00 $679.00 $679.00 $679.00 Min Sell Price BASF 190538
101 [Imazapic (Plateau, Panoramic 2sl) or equal 10 1 gal v $136.98 $136.98 $136.98 $136.98 Alligare 221169
102 |Sulfometuron/Chlorsulfuron (Landmark XP) or equal 192 64 oz v Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued |Discontinued
Method 240SL
103 |Aminocycloprachlor (25% A.l.) (Method) or equal (quarts were 2.5 gal $912.00 $364.80 $912.00 $364.80 Min Sell Price Environmental Sc|234944
discontinued) v
104 |[Pyraflufen 2% (Venue) or equal Venue 20 1qt v $121.98 $121.98 $121.98 $121.98 Nichino 170718
105 [Chlorosulfuron (Telar XP) or equal Telar XP 416 8oz 4 $111.28 $13.91 $111.28 $13.91 Environmental Sc|240937
106 [Rimsulfuron (Laramie 25DF) or equal Laramie 3,200 16 oz v $72.64 $4.54 $72.64 $4.54 Alligare 239799
107 [Metsulfuron (Escort) or equal Escort XP 160 8oz v $18.80 $2.35 $18.80 $2.35 Environmental Sc|233153
108 |Flumioxazin (Payload) or equal Promenade 120 12 1b v Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued |Discontinued Alligare 259088
B il-Di 40% B il, 40% Di , 20% oth X .
109 |Bromacil-Diuron (40% Bromacil, 40% Diuron, 20% other  |o 1 1640 9% 61b v $72.00 $12.00 $72.00 $12.00 Alligare 226768
ingredients) - (Krovar | DF, Bromacil/Diuron 40/40) or equal
| -Di 7.78% | 5 62.22% Di .
110 |!mazapyr-Diuron (7.78% Imazapyr % Diuron) _ 10 5lb v $57.30 $11.46 $57.30 $11.46 Alligare 202367
(Mojave) or equal Mojave
Flumi in, 33.5% A.l., P If 42.5% A.l. (Pi . . . . . . . " . . .
111 umioxazin ? yroxasulione ? (Piper) or Piper 15 3.751b 4 Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued Corteva 220573

Bulk Products
Cost of th Cost of th
Item A Estimated Not to Exceed | Chemical Form os' ° 3 € Price per UOM os' ° 3 € Price per UOM
Herbicdes Trade Name . . ) L. ) Container Size(s) Container Size(s) Comment Manufacturer SKU
No. Quantities Container Size Liquid  Solid 10.1.25 2.1.26
10.1.25 2.1.26
112 |2,4-D, Dicamba (Veteran 720) or equal Veteran 250 Gallon 220 gal Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued  [Sub - E-2 Nufarm 211157
v
113 D'melthy'am'”e Salt2,4-D + Fluroxypyr + Dicamba (E2) or | 500 Gallon 250 gal L, $15,862.50 $63.45 $15,862.50 $63.45 Min Sell Price Nufarm 221542
equa
114 |Fluroxypyr 1-methylheptyl ester + 2-4,D (TrumpCard) 1250 Gallon 250 gal
ypy yinepty ! P Returnables v
115 |2,4-D, Dicamba (Veteran 720) or equal Rangestar 250 Gallon 270 gal v $5,766.40 $21.76 $5,766.40 $21.76 265 GA package size 191034
116 (2,4-D Amine (Weedar 64)or equal Alligare 2,4-D Amine| 750 Gallon 270 gal v $6,115.50 $22.65 $6,115.50 $22.65 Alligare 236747
250 gal
117 |Fluroxypyr 1-methylheptyl ester + 2-4,D (TrumpCard) 1250 Gallon
Returnables v
118 D'melthy'am'"e Salt 2,4-D + Fluroxypyr + Dicamba (E2)or | 500 Gallon 250 gal , $15,862.50 $63.45 $15,862.50 $63.45 Min Sell Price Nufarm 221542
equa
250 gal
119 |Aminocycloprachlor (25% A.l.) (Method 240 SL) or equal Method 240 SL 500 Gallon Returni?)les v $91,200.00 $364.80 $91,200.00 $364.80 Min Sell Price Environmental Sc|240404

||
Blended Bulk Products

Cost of the Cost of the
Item A Estimated Not to Exceed | Chemical Form . 3 Price per UOM . 3 Price per UOM
Herbicdes Trade Name . . ) L. ) Container Size(s) Container Size(s) Comment Manufacturer
No. Quantities Container Size Liquid  Solid 10.1.25 2.1.26
10.1.25 2.1.26
Frequency (10 0z) +
Lock Down (10 oz) +
Roundup Pro 250 gal
120 Concentrate (32 07) 250 Gallon Returnables $31,314.15 $125.25 $31,314.15 $125.25 See blend sheet for cost per container
u
Frequency (10 oz) + Lock Down (10 oz) + Roundup Pro Rate is 96 oz per acre
Concentrate (32 0z) (333.3 acres) '




120

Frequency (10 oz) + Lock Down (10 oz) + Roundup Pro
Concentrate (32 0z)

Lock Down (10 oz) +
Roundup Pro
Concentrate (32 0z)
Rate is 128 oz per
acre (250 acres) less

250 Gallon

250 gal
Returnables

$24,923.12

$99.69

$24,923.12

$99.69

See blend sheet for cost per container

121

Frequency (10 oz) + Lock Down (12 oz) + Detail (1 oz) + Escort (1
oz)

Frequency (10 oz) +

Lock Down (12 oz) +
Detail (1 oz) + Escort
(1 0z) Rateis 64 o0z
per acre (500 acres)

250 Gallon

250 gal
Returnables

$49,656.25

$198.62

$49,656.25

$198.62

See blend sheet for cost per container

121

Frequency (10 oz) + Lock Down (12 oz) + Detail (1 oz) + Escort (1
oz)

Frequency (10 oz) +
Lock Down (12 oz) +
Detail (1 oz) + Escort
(1 92) I}atejér 128 oz

250 Gallon

250 gal
Returnables

$25,453.12

$101.81

$25,453.12

$101.81

See blend sheet for cost per container

122

Frequency (10 oz) + Plateau (12 oz) + Detail (1 oz) + Escort (1.5
oz)

(12 oz) + Detail (1 oz) +
Escort (1.5 oz) Rate
is 64 oz per acre (500
acres)

250 Gallon

250 gal
Returnables

$38,781.25

$155.12

$38,781.25

$155.12

See blend sheet for cost per container

122

Frequency (10 oz) + Plateau (12 oz) + Detail (1 oz) + Escort (1.5
oz)

(12 oz) + Detail (1 oz) +
Escort (1.5 oz) Rate
is 128 oz per acre (250
acres) less chance of
product droppiing out

250 Gallon

250 gal
Returnables

$19,352.56

$77.41

$19,352.56

$77.41

See blend sheet for cost per container

123

EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Method 240 sl (12.7 oz) + Telar XP (1.5
oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (16 oz)

I:Spl/-\l'fahe ZUUSC(S
oz) + Method 240 s!
(12.7 oz) + Telar XP
(1.5 0z) + Roundup
Pro Concentrate (16
oz) Rateis 64 oz per
acre (500 acres)

250 Gallon

250 gal
Returnables

$60,402.56

$241.61

$60,402.56

$241.61

See blend sheet for cost per container

123

EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Method 240 sl (12.7 oz) + Telar XP (1.5
oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (16 oz)

EsplAnade 200 sc (5
oz) + Method 240 s|
(12.7 oz) + Telar XP
(1.5 0z) + Roundup
Pro Concentrate (16

250 Gallon

250 gal
Returnables

$29,938.00

$119.75

$29,938.00

$119.75

See blend sheet for cost per container

124

EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Method 240 sl (12.7 oz) + Escort XP (1.5
oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (16 oz)

I'.Spl/-\l'fahe ZUUSC(S
oz) + Method 240 s!
(12.7 oz) + Escort XP
(1.5 0z) + Roundup
Pro Concentrate (16
oz) Rateis 64 oz per
acre (500 acres)

250 Gallon

250 gal
Returnables

$53,665.84

$214.66

$53,665.84

$214.66

See blend sheet for cost per container

124

EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Method 240 sl (12.7 oz) + Escort XP (1.5
0z) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (16 0z)

oz) + Method 240 sl
(12.7 oz) + Escort XP
(1.5 oz) + Roundup

Pro Concentrate (16

250 Gallon

250 gal
Returnables

$26,588.78

$106.35

$26,588.78

$106.35

See blend sheet for cost per container

125

EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Lock Down (10 oz) + Detail (1 0z) +
Roundup Pro Concentrate (32 oz)

ESPIANade Z0USTTS
oz) + Lock Down (10
oz) + Detail (1 0z) +
Roundup Pro
Concentrate (32 0z)
Rate is 96 oz per acre
(333.3 acres)

250 Gallon

250 gal
Returnables

$36,827.52

$147.31

$36,827.52

$147.31

See blend sheet for cost per container

125

EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Lock Down (10 oz) + Detail (1 0z) +
Roundup Pro Concentrate (32 oz)

ESpIAnade 200 sc (5
oz) + Lock Down (10
oz) + Detail (1 0z) +
Roundup Pro

Concentrate (32 0z)

250 Gallon

250 gal
Returnables

$27,645.78

$110.58

$27,645.78

$110.58

See blend sheet for cost per container




126

EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Milestone (7 oz) + Method 240 sl (12.7
oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (32 oz)

EsplAnade 200 sc (5
oz) + Milestone (7 oz)
+ Method 240 sl (12.7
oz) + Roundup Pro
Concentrate (32 oz)
Rate is 96 oz per acre
(333.3 acres)

250 Gallon

250 gal
Returnables

$41,824.08

$167.29

$41,824.08

$167.29

See blend sheet for cost per container

126

EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Milestone (7 oz) + Method 240 sl (12.7
0z) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (32 oz)

oz) + Milestone (7 0z)
+ Method 240 sl (12.7
0z) + Roundup Pro
Concentrate (32 oz)

250 Gallon

250 gal
Returnables

$31,253.46

$125.01

$31,253.46

$125.01

See blend sheet for cost per container

127

EsplAnade (5 oz) + Milestone (7 oz) + Escort XP (1.5 oz) +
Roundup Pro Concentrate (51 0z)

Milestone (7 oz) +
Escort XP (1.5 oz) +
Roundup Pro
Concentrate (51 oz)

250 Gallon

250 gal
Returnables

$33,308.52

$133.23

$33,308.52

$133.23

See blend sheet for cost per container

127

EsplAnade (5 oz) + Milestone (7 oz) + Escort XP (1.5 oz) +
Roundup Pro Concentrate (51 0z)

TSPTATIaUE (3 Uz T
Milestone (7 oz) +
Escort XP (1.5 oz) +
Roundup Pro
Concentrate (51 oz)
Rate is 128 oz per
acre (250 acres) less
chance of product
dropping out

250 Gallon

250 gal
Returnables

<«

$25,107.57

$100.43

$25,107.57

$100.43

See blend sheet for cost per container

Flumioxazin + pyroxasulfone Piper EZ 2.5 gal v $877.50 $351.00 $877.50 $351.00 Min Sell Price Corteva 281386
Clopyralid Transline 2.5 gal v $334.63 $133.85 $334.63 $133.85 Corteva 105821
Water conditioner, drift control, non-ionic surfactant Bronc Triple 2.5 gal v $62.50 $25.00 $62.50 $25.00 Wilbur-Ellis 192300
Indaziflam Rejuvra 2.5 gal v $2,838.40 $1,135.36 $2,883.20 $1,153.28 Min Sell Price Environmental Sc|267778
Indaziflam Rejuvra 1grt v $346.24 $346.24 $351.04 $351.04 Min Sell Price Environmental Sc|273103
Aminopyralid HighNoon 2.5 gal v $245.00 $98.00 $245.00 $98.00 Min Sell Price Corteva 279657
Aminopyralid HighNoon 1 gal v $98.00 $98.00 $98.00 $98.00 Min Sell Price Corteva 279656
Indaziflam Plainview SC 2.5 gal v $739.20 $295.68 $739.20 $295.68 Min Sell Price Environmental Sc|263968
Aminopyralid Opensight 10 b $1,055.00 $105.50 $1,055.00 $105.50 Min Sell Price Corteva 201303
Aminopyralid Opensight 1.251b $131.88 $105.50 $131.88 $105.50 Min Sell Price Corteva 187309

See attached letter
See attached letter



Item # 120
Frequency
Lock Down
roundup pro
blend and ship

Item # 120
Frequency
Lock Down
roundup pro
blend and ship

Item # 121
Frequency
Lock Down
Detail

Escort XP
blend and ship

Item # 121
Frequency
Lock Down
Detail

Escort XP
blend and ship

Item # 122
Frequency

Plateau / Panorar

Detail
Escort XP
blend and ship

Item # 122
Frequency

Plateau / Panorar

Detail
Escort XP
blend and ship

Item # 123

Esplanade 200 sc

Method 240SL

250 gallon tote
10 oz/acre
10 oz/acre
32 oz/acre
52 oz

250 gallon tote
10 oz/acre
10 oz/acre
32 oz/acre
52 oz

250 gallon tote
10 oz/acre
12 oz/acre
1 oz/acre
1 oz/acre
24 oz

250 gallon tote
10 oz/acre
12 oz/acre
1 oz/acre
1 oz/acre
24 oz

250 gallon tote
10 oz/acre
12 oz/acre
1 oz/acre
1.5 oz/acre
24.5 oz

250 gallon tote
10 oz/acre
12 oz/acre
1 oz/acre
1.5 oz/acre
24.5 oz

250 gallon tote
5 oz/acre
12.7 oz/acre

rate is 96 oz per acre(333.3ac)
3333.33 oz
3333.33 oz
10665.6 oz

$31,314.15

rate is 128 oz per acre (250 ac)
2,500 oz
2,500 oz
10665.6 oz

$24,923.12

rate is 64 oz per acre(500ac)
5000 oz
6000 oz
500 oz
500 oz

$49,656.25

rate is 128 oz per acre(250 ac)
2,500 oz
3,000 oz
250 oz
250 oz

$25,453.12

rate is 64 oz per acre(500 ac)
5000 oz
6000 oz
500 oz
750 oz

$38,781.25

rate is 128 oz per acre(250 ac)
2,500 oz
3,000 oz
250 oz
375 oz

$19,352.56

rate is 64 oz per acre(500ac)
2500 oz
6350 oz

$125.25 /gallon

$99.69 /gallon

$198.62 /gallon

$101.81 /gallon

$155.12 /gallon

$77.41 /gallon



Telar 1.5 oz/acre
roundup pro 16 oz/acre
blend and ship  35.2 oz

Item # 123 250 gallon tote

Esplanade 200 sc 5 oz/acre
Method 240SL 12.7 oz/acre
Telar 1.5 oz/acre
roundup pro 16 oz/acre

blend and ship  35.2 0z

Item # 124 250 gallon tote

Esplanade 200 sc 5 oz/acre
Method 240SL 12.7 oz/acre
Escort XP 1.5 oz/acre
roundup pro 16 oz/acre

blend and ship  35.2 0z

Item # 124 250 gallon tote

Esplanade 200 sc 5 oz/acre
Method 240SL 12.7 oz/acre
Escort XP 1.5 oz/acre
roundup pro 16 oz/acre

blend and ship  35.2 oz

Item # 125 250 gallon tote

Esplanade 200 sc 5 oz/acre
Lockdown 10 oz/acre
Detail 1 oz/acre
Roundup Pro 32 oz/acre

blend and ship 48 oz

Item # 125 250 gallon tote

Esplanade 200 sc 5 oz/acre
Lockdown 10 oz/acre
Detail 1 oz/acre
Roundup Pro 32 oz/acre

blend and ship 48 oz

Item # 126 250 gallon tote
Esplanade 200 sc 5 oz/acre
Milestone 7 oz/acre

Method 240s| 12.7 oz/acre

750 oz
8000 oz

$60,402.56

rate is 128 oz per acre (250 ac)
1250 oz
3175 oz
375 oz
4000 oz

$29,938.00

rate is 64 oz per acre(500ac)
2500 oz
6350 oz
750 oz
8000 oz

$53,665.84

rate is 128 oz per acre (250 ac)
1250 oz
3175 oz
375 oz
4000 oz

$26,588.78

rate is 96 oz per acre(333.3ac)
1666.5 oz
3333 oz
333.3 oz
10665.6 oz

$36,827.53

rate is 128 oz per acre (250 ac)
1250 oz
2,500 oz
250 oz
8,000 oz

$27,645.78

rate is 96 oz per acre(333.3ac)
1666.5 oz
2333.1 oz
4232.91 oz

$241.61 /gallon

$119.75 /gallon

$214.66 /gallon

106.35 /gallon

$147.31 /gallon

$110.58 /gallon



Roundup Pro 32
blend and ship  56.7 oz

Item # 126 250 gallon tote
Esplanade 200 sc 5
Milestone 7
Method 240sl| 12.7
Roundup Pro 32
blend and ship  56.7 oz

Item # 127 250 gallon tote
Esplanade 200 sc 5
Milestone 7
Escort XP 15
Roundup Pro 51
blend and ship  64.5 oz

Item # 127 250 gallon tote
Esplanade 200 sc 5
Milestone 7
Escort XP 15
Roundup Pro 51

blend and ship  64.5 oz

oz/acre

oz/acre
oz/acre
oz/acre
oz/acre

oz/acre
oz/acre
oz/acre
oz/acre

oz/acre
oz/acre
oz/acre
oz/acre

10,665.60 oz

$41,824.08

rate is 128 oz per acre (250 ac)
1,250 oz
1,750 oz
3,175 oz
8,000 oz

$31,253.46

rate is 96 oz per acre(333.3ac)
1666.5 oz
2333.1 oz
499.95 oz
16998.3 oz

$33,308.52

rate is 128 oz per acre (250 ac)
1,250 oz
1,750 oz
375 oz
12,750 oz

$25,107.57

$167.29 /gallon

$125.01 /gallon

$133.23 /gallon

$100.43 /gallon



