Bidder Name: Wilbur Ellis

ATTACHMENT D - PRICE SCHEDULE

Bidder's Authorized Representative:

Jerry Ellis

Phone: (509)350-3624

ADJUVENTS TRADE NAME
Item di d Estimated Not to Exceed |Chemical Form
No. Adjuvants Trade Name Quantities Container Size | Liquid Solid
1 | Drift Control (Justified or Crosshair) Crosshair 350 2.5 gal i
2 Blend of Modified Vegetable‘0|l + Organosilicone Syl-tac EA )
Surfactant (Syl-Tac, Dyne-amic, Phase) 10 2.5 gal i
Blend of Modified Vegetable Oil + Organosilicone
3 |Surfactant with Aquatic Label (Syl-Tac EA, Dyne-amic, Syl-tac EA
Phase) 10 2.5 gal {
4  |Non-lonic Surfactant (Activator 90) 10 2.5 gal i
5 |Non-lonic Surfactant with Aquatic Label (Rainier-EA) Rainier EA 10 2.5 gal i
6 |Non-lonic Surfactant (Generic 80% or better) Alligare 90 130 2.5 gal i
7 |Aquatic Surfactant (Agri-Dex) 910 2.5 gal ¥
8 |Bareground Surfact + Drift Agent (Grounded) 115 2.5 gal ¥
9  |Bareground Surfact + Drift Agent (Efficax) Efficax 115 2.5 gal ¥
11 |Spray Colorant (Hi-Light Blue) Hi-Light Blue 155 2.5 gal ¥
12 |Penetrant + Drift Control (Liberate) 160 2.5 gal ¥
13 |Penetrating Surfactant (Hel-Fire) 40 2.5 gal ¥
MSO + Non-lonic + UAN Solution with Aquatic Label
14 (Renegade-EA) Renegade EA 20 2.5 gal ¥
15 |Drift & Deposition Agent with Aquatic Label (Diligence-EA) |Diligence EA 40 25 gal
16 |Antifoam (Defoamer) De-Foamer 68 1qt
ADJUVENTS GENERIC NAME
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Item Generic Manufacturer & Chemical Name Generic Name Estima_tfed Not t‘f Exce\_ed Ch\_emfcal For_rn
No. Quantities | ContainerSize | Liquid Solid
17 | Drift Control (Justified or Crosshair) Crosshair 350 2.5 gal ¥
Blend of Modified Vegetable Oil + Organosilicone .
18 Surfactant (Syl-Tac, Dyne-amic, Phase) MVO Plus (Alligare) 10 2.5 gal ¥
Blend of Modified Vegetable Oil + Organosilicone
19 |Surfactant with Aquatic Label (Syl-Tac EA, Dyne-amic, MVO Plus (Alligare)
Phase) 10 2.5 gal ¥
20 |Non-lonic Surfactant (Activator 90) Alligare 90 10 2.5 gal ¥
21 |Non-lonic Surfactant with Aquatic Label (Rainier-EA) Alligare 90 10 2.5 gal ¥
22 |Non-lonic Surfactant (Generic 80% or better) Alligare 90 130 2.5 gal ¥
23 |Aquatic Surfactant (Agri-Dex) MSO 1 910 2.5 gal ¥
24 |Bareground Surfact + Drift Agent (Grounded) 115 2.5 gal ¥
25 |Bareground Surfact + Drift Agent (Efficax) Efficax 115 2.5 gal ¥
27 |Spray Colorant (Hi-Light Blue) Super Marking Dye 155 2.5 gal ¥
28 |Penetrant + Drift Control (Liberate) Alligare 7 160 2.5 gal ¥
29 |Penetrating Surfactant (Hel-Fire) Brimstone 40 2.5 gal ¥
30 MSO + Non-lonic + UAN Solution with Aquatic Label Renegade EA
(Renegade-EA) 20 2.5 gal ¥
31 |Drift & Deposition Agent with Aquatic Label (Diligence-EA) |Diligence EA 0 25 gal
32 |Antifoam (Defoamer, Generic) De-Foamer 68 1qt
HERBICIDES TRADE NAME
Item . Estimated Not to Exceed |Chemical Form
No. Herbicdes Trade Name Quantities Container Size | Liquid Solid
33 Glyp‘hosate -41% A.l.; 59% other ingredients (Glystar Glystar Original 60 30 gal :
original) or equal i
34 |Diglycolamine (Vanquish, Dicamba HD) or equal Dicamba HD 250 30 gal U
35 |Picloram (Tordon 22K) or equal Tordon 22K 30 30 gal i
36 |2,4-D, Dicamba (Veteran 720) or equal Rangestar 90 30 gal i
37 |2,4-D Acid (Hardball) or equal 60 30 gal {
38 |2,4-D Choline (Freelexx) or equal Freelexx 30 30 gal i
3-(3,4-dichlorophenyl)-1, 1-dimethylurea (Diuron 4L); 40% | .
39 A.l. (60% inert ingredients) or equal Diuron 4L 90 30gal i
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Glyphosate - 53.8% A.l.; 46.2% other ingredients with

40 aquatic label (Aquaneat) or equal Glyphosate 5.4 100 25@l ¥
41 |2,4-D Amine (Weedar 64) or equal 2,4-D Amine 115 2.5 gal U
42 |Triclopyr (Garlon 4 Ultra) or equal Garlon 4 Ultra 20 2.5 gal U
43 |Triclopyr Choline (Vastlan) or equal Vastlan 20 2.5 gal U
44 | Triclopyr (Garlon 3) or equal Garlon 3 20 2.5 gal U
45  |Fluroxypyr (Vista XRT) or equal Vista XRT 45 2.5 gal U
46 |2,4-D 39.6% + Picloram 10.2% (Tordon 101) or equal 70 2.5 gal U
Picloram 14.4% (4-amino-3,5,6-trichloro-2-
47 |pyridinecarboxylic acid) + 2,4-D 43.6% (2,4- Graslan L 810 2 gal
dichlorophenoxy acetic acid, choline salt (Graslan) or equal U
48 |Aminopyralid (Milestone) or equal Milestone 268 2.5 gal ¥
49 |2,4-D + triclopyr BEE (Crosshow) or equal Crossbow 10 2.5 gal U
50 |Indaziflam (EsplAnade 200 SC) or equal Esplanade 200 SC 20 2.5 gal U
51 |Indaziflam (EsplAnade EZ) or equal Esplanade EZ 50 2.5 gal U
52 [Fluroxypyr 1-methylheptyl ester + 2-4,D (TrumpCard) 250 2.5 gal U
53 Dimethylamine Salt 2,4-D + Fluroxypyr + Dicamba (E2) or E-2 265 25 gal )
equal ¥
54 Imazapyr - 27.7% A.l. (73.3% Other Ingredients) (Polaris) or 30 25 gal
equal Ecomazapyr 25L
55 |Triclopyr (Trycera) or equal 25 2.5 gal
56 |Flumioxazin, 44% A.l. (Lock Down SC) or equal Lockdown SC 25 2.5 gal
57 |Aminocycloprachlor (25% A.l.) (Method 240 SL) or equal Method 240SL 30 2.5 gal i
ss Penoxsulan 0.85% + Oxyflurorfen 40.31% (Cleantraxx) or Cleantrax 20 25 gal )
equal ¥
59 |Sulfentrazone 39.6% A.l. (Portfolio 4F) Portfolio 4F 20 2.5 gal U
60 |2,4-D 34.2% + Trichlopyr 15.2% (AquaSweep) AgquaSweep 20 2.5 gal U
61 |Topramezone (Frequency) or equal Frequency 55 1 gal U
62 |Imazapic (Plateau) or equal Plateau 10 1 gal U
63 |Sulfometuron/Chlorsulfuron (Landmark XP) or equal 192 64 oz U
64 |Pyraflufen 2% (Venue) or equal Venue 20 1qt ¥
65 |Rimsulfuron (Matrix SG) or equal Laramie 25DF 10,500 16 oz
66 |Metsulfuron (Escort) or equal Escort XP 160 16 oz
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67 |Chlorosulfuron (Telar XP) or equal Telar XP 416 8oz (¥
68 |Flumioxazin, 51% A.l. (Payload) or equal Payload 120 12 1b U
Bromacil-Diuron (40% Bromacil, 40% Diuron, 20% other
69 |ingredients) - (Krovar | DF, Bromacil/Diuron 40/40) or Bromacil 40/40 96 6lb i
equal
70 Imaz‘apyr—Dluron (7.78% Imazapyr; 62.22% Diuron) ‘ 10 5 Ib 4
(Mojave) or equal Mojave
7 Flumioxazin, 33.5% A.l., Pyroxasulfone 42.5% A.l. (Piper) or Piper 15 3.75 b 5
equal
72 |Dicamba Acid (Vision) or equal 100 2.5 gal i
HERBICIDES GENERIC
Item Generic Manufacturer & Chemical Name Generic Name Estimated Notto Excead | Chemica) Farm
No. Quantities Container Size | Liquid Solid
72 Glyp‘hosate -41% A.l.; 59% other ingredients (Glystar Glystar Original 60 30 gal )
original) or equal i
73 |Diglycolamine (Vanquish, Dicamba HD) or equal Dicamba HD 250 30 gal i
74 |Picloram (Tordon 22K) or equal 30 30 gal U
75 |2,4-D, Dicamba (Veteran 720) or equal Rangestar 90 30 gal i
76 |2,4-D Acid (Hardball) or equal 60 30 gal i
77 |2,4-D Choline (Freelexx) or equal Freelexx 30 30 gal i
3-(3,4-dichlorophenyl)-1, 1-dimethylurea (Diuron 4L); 40% | .
78 A.l. (60% inert ingredients) or equal Diuron 4L 90 30gal i
Glyphosate - 53.8% A.l.; 46.2% other ingredients with
9 aquatic label (Aquaneat) or equal Glyphosate 5.4 100 25 gal i
80 |2,4-D Amine (Weedar 64) or equal 2,4-D Amine 115 2.5 gal i
81 |Triclopyr (Garlon 4 Ultra, Element 4) or equal Element 4 20 2.5 gal i
82 |Triclopyr Choline (Vastlan) or equal Vastlan 20 2.5 gal i
83 |Triclopyr (Garlon 3, Element 3A) or equal Element 3A 20 2.5 gal i
84 |Fluroxypyr (Vista XRT) or equal Vista XRT 45 2.5 gal i
85 |2,4-D 39.6% + Picloram 10.2% (Tordon 101) or equal 70 2.5 gal U
Picloram 14.4% (4-amino-3,5,6-trichloro-2-
86 |pyridinecarboxylic acid) + 2,4-D 43.6% (2,4- 810 2.5 gal
dichlorophenoxy acetic acid, choline salt (Graslan) or equal .
Graslan L i
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‘ Bulk Products

87 |Aminopyralid (Milestone) or equal Milestone 268 2.5 gal ¥

88 |2,4-D + triclopyr BEE (Crosshow) or equal Crossbow 10 2.5 gal U

89 |Indaziflam (EsplAnade 200 SC) or equal Esplanade 200 SC 20 2.5 gal U

90 |Indaziflam (EsplAnade EZ) or equal Esplanade EZ 50 2.5 gal U

91 |Fluroxypyr 1-methylheptyl ester + 2-4,D (TrumpCard) 250 2.5 gal U

9 Dimethylamine Salt 2,4-D + Fluroxypyr + Dicamba (E2) or E2 265 25 gal )
equal ¥

o3 Imazapyr - 27.7% A.l. (73.3% Other Ingredients) (Polaris) or 30 2.5 gal
equal Ecomazapyr 25L v}

94 |Triclopyr (Trycera) or equal 25 2.5 gal U

95 |Flumioxazin, 44% A.l. (Lock Down SC) or equal Promenade SC 25 2.5 gal ¥

9% Penoxsulan 0.85% + Oxyflurorfen 40.31% (Cleantraxx) or Cleantrax 20 25 gal )
equal ¥

97 |Sulfentrazone 39.6% A.l. (Portfolio 4F) Portfolio 4F 20 2.5 gal U

98 |2,4-D 34.2% + Trichlopyr 15.2% (AquaSweep) AgquaSweep 20 2.5 gal U

99 |Aminocycloprachlor (25% A.l.) (Method) or equal Method 240SL 30 2.5 gal ¥

100 |Topramezone (Frequency) or equal Frequency 55 1 gal U

101 [Imazapic (Plateau, Panoramic 2sl) or equal Panoramic 2SL 10 1 gal ¥

102 |Sulfometuron/Chlorsulfuron (Landmark XP) or equal 192 64 oz U

103 [Aminocycloprachlor (25% A.l.) (Method) or equal Method 240SL (quarts were discontinued) 2.5 gal U

104 |Pyraflufen 2% (Venue) or equal Venue 20 1qt ¥

105 |Chlorosulfuron (Telar XP) or equal Telar XP 416 8oz ¥

106 |Rimsulfuron (Laramie 25DF) or equal Laramie 3,200 16 oz ¥

107 |Metsulfuron (Escort) or equal Escort XP 160 8 oz ¥

108 |[Flumioxazin (Payload) or equal Promenade 120 12 b ¥
Bromacil-Diuron (40% Bromacil, 40% Diuron, 20% other

109 |ingredients) - (Krovar | DF, Bromacil/Diuron 40/40) or Bromacil 40/40 96 6lb i
equal

110 Imaz‘apyr-Dluron (7.78% Imazapyr; 62.22% Diuron) ‘ 10 5ib 3
(Mojave) or equal Mojave

11 Zl:urr;:oxazm, 33.5% A.l., Pyroxasulfone 42.5% A.I. (Piper) or Piper 15 3.75 Ib 3
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Blended Bulk Products

Item Herbicdes Trade N Estimated Not to Exceed |Chemical Form
No. erbic rade Name Quantities | ContainerSize | Liquid Solid
112 |2,4-D, Dicamba (Veteran 720) or equal Veteran 250 Gallon 220 gal ¥
113 Dimethylamine Salt 2,4-D + Fluroxypyr + Dicamba (E2) or E2 500 Gallon 250 gal )

equal ¥
114 |Fluroxypyr 1-methylheptyl ester + 2-4,D (TrumpCard) 1250 Gallon 250 gal
Returnables
115 |2,4-D, Dicamba (Veteran 720) or equal Rangestar 250 Gallon 270 gal
116 |2,4-D Amine (Weedar 64)or equal Alligare 2,4-D Amine 750 Gallon 270 gal
250 gal
117 |Fluroxypyr 1-methylheptyl ester + 2-4,D (TrumpCard) 1250 Gallon Returnables i
118 Dimethylamine Salt 2,4-D + Fluroxypyr + Dicamba (E2) or E-2 500 Gallon 250 gal “
equal ¥
119 |Aminocycloprachlor (25% A.l.) (Method 240 SL) or equal Method 240 SL 500 Gallon 250 gal
Returnables ¥

Item Herbicdes Trade Name Estimated Not to Exceed |Chemical Form
No. Quantities Container Size | Liquid Solid
Frequency (10 oz) + Lock Down (10 oz} + Roundup Pro 250 gal
120 |Frequency (10 oz) + Lock Down (10 oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (32 0z) Rateis 96 oz per acre (333.3 250 Gallon bl
Concentrate (32 0z) acres) Returnables i
Frequency (10 oz) + Lock Down (10 oz) + Roundup Pro 250 gal
120 |Frequency (10 oz) + Lock Down (10 oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (32 0z) Rateis 128 oz per acre (250 250 Gallon bl
Concentrate (32 oz) acres) less chance of product dropping out Returnables v}
121 Frequency (10 oz) + Lock Down (12 oz) + Detail (1 0z) + Escort (1 |Frequency (10 oz) + Lock Down (12 oz) + Detail (1 0z) + 250 Gall 250 gal
0z) Escort (1 0z) Rate is 64 oz per acre (500 acres) aflon Returnables i
. Frequency (10 oz) + Lock Down (12 oz) + Detail (1 oz) +
121 ::;quency (10 oz) + Lock Down (12 oz) + Detail (1 oz) + Escort (1 Escort (10z) Rate is 128 oz per acre (250 acres) less 250 Gallon 250 gal
chance of product dropping out Returnables i
122 |Frequency (10 oz) + Plateau (12 oz) + Detail (1 0z) +Escort (15 |Frequency (10 oz) + Plateau (12 0z) + Detall (1 0z) + Escort (1.5 02) 250 Gallon 250 gal
0z) Rate is 64 oz per acre (500 acres) Returnables ¥}
Frequency (10 oz) + Plateau (12 oz) + Detail (1 oz) + Escort (1.5 0z) 250 ga|
122 |Frequency (10 oz) + Plateau (12 oz) + Detail (1 0z) +Escort (1.5 | Rate is 128 oz per acre (250 acres) less chance of product 250 Gallon Returnables
oz) droppiing out u u
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EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Method 240 sl (12.7 0z) +

250 gal

123 |EsplAnade 200 sc (5 0z) + Method 240 sl (12.7 oz) + Telar XP (1.5 |Telar XP (1.5 oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (16 oz) 250 Gallon
oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (16 oz) Rate is 64 oz per acre (500 acres) Returnables
EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Method 240 sl (12.7 0z) +
123 Telar XP (1.5 oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (16 oz) 250 Gallon 250 gal
EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Method 240 sl (12.7 0z) + Telar XP (1.5 |Rate is 128 oz per acre (250 acres) less chance of Returnables
oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (16 oz) product dropping out
EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Method 240 sl (12.7 02) + 250 gal
124 |EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Method 240 sl (12.7 oz) + Escort XP (1.5 | Escort XP (1.5 0z) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (16 oz) 250 Gallon
oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (16 oz) Rate is 64 oz per acre (500 acres) Returnables
EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Method 240 sl (12.7 0z) +
124 Escort XP (1.5 0z) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (16 02) | 55 Gallon 250 gal
EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Method 240 sl (12.7 oz) + Escort XP (1.5 | Rate is 128 oz per acre (250 acres) less chance of Returnables
oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (16 oz) product dropping out
EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Lock Down (10 0z) + Detail 250
. - gal
125 |EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Lock Down (10 oz} + Detail (1 0z) + (1 0z) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (32 oz) Rate is 96 250 Gallon
Roundup Pro Concentrate (32 oz) oz per acre (333.3 acres) Returnables
EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Lock Down (10 0z) + Detail 250 gal
125 (1 0z) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (32 oz) Rateis128 | 250 Gallon
EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Lock Down (10 oz) + Detail (1 0z) + oz per acre (250 acres) less chance of product Returnables
Roundup Pro Concentrate (32 oz) dropping out
126 EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Milestone (7 oz) + Method 250 Gallon 250 gal
EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Milestone (7 oz) + Method 240 sl (12.7 |240 sl (12.7 oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (32 oz) Returnables
oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (32 oz) Rate is 96 oz per acre (333.3 acres)
EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Milestone (7 oz) + Method
126 240 s1(12.7 oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (32 0z) 250 Gallon 250 gal
EsplAnade 200 sc (5 oz) + Milestone (7 oz) + Method 240 sl (12.7 [Rate is 128 oz per acre (250 acres) less chance of Returnables
oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (32 oz) product dropping out
126 Esplanade (5 0z) + Milestone (7 oz) + Escort XP (1.5 250 Gallon 250 gal
EsplAnade (5 oz) + Milestone (7 oz) + Escort XP (1.5 0z) + oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (51 oz) Rateis 96 oz Returnables
Roundup Pro Concentrate (51 oz) per acre (333.3 acres)
EsplAnade (5 oz) + Milestone (7 0z) + Escort XP (1.5
127 oz) + Roundup Pro Concentrate (51 oz) Rateis 128 oz 250 Gallon 250 gal

EsplAnade (5 oz) + Milestone (7 oz) + Escort XP (1.5 oz) +
Roundup Pro Concentrate (51 oz)

per acre (250 acres) less chance of product dropping
out

Returnables
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Cost of the Container Size(s) Price Per Gallon
$100.00 $40.00/gallon
$100.00 $40.00/gallon
$100.00 $40.00/gallon

No Bid No Bid
$72.50 $29.00/gallon
$20.83 58.33/gallon
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
$123.60 $49.44/gallon
$92.93 $37.17/gallon
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
$62.50 $25.00/gallon
$772.50 $309.00/gallon
$6.44 $6.44/quart
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Cost of the Container Size(s) Price Per Gallon
$100.00 $40.00/gallon
$61.77 $24.71/gallon
$61.77 $24.71/gallon
$20.83 $8.333/gallon
$20.83 $8.33/gallon
$20.83 $8.33/gallon
$36.88 $14.75/gallon
No Bid No Bid
$123.60 $49.44/gallon
$70.65 $28.26/gallon
$49.60 $19.84/gallon
$60.00 $24.00/gallon
$62.50 $25.00/gallon
$772.50 $309.00/gallon
$6.44 $6.44/quart
Cost of the Container Size(s) Price Per Gallon or Pound
$313.20 $10.44/gallon
$1,140.00 $38.00/gallon
$1,33.33 $44.44/gallon
$523.33 $17.44/gallon
no bid no bid
$600.00 $20.00/gallon
$489.60 $16.32/gallon
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$33.89

$13.55/gallon

$23.65 $9.46/gallon
$172.89 $69.16/gallon
$218.75 $87.50/gallon
$126.71 $50.68/gallon
$315.80 $126.32/gallon
No Bid No Bid
$76.81 $38.40/gallon
$662.50 $265.00/gallon
$76.28 $30.51/gallon
$2,972.80 $1,189.12/gallon
$119.58 $47.83/gallon
no bid no bid
$105.00 $42.00/gallon
$114.48 $45.79/gallon
no bid No Bid
$933.33 $373.33/gallon
$806.40 $322.56/gallon
$320.00 $128.00/gallon
$1,025.00 $410.00/gallon
$120.00 $48.00/gallon
$600.00 $600.00/gallon
$121.00 $121.00/gallon
Discontinued Discontinued
$119.00 $119.00/gallon
$63.04 $3.94/ounce
$33.60 $2.10/ounce
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$87.36 $10.92/gallon

$543.16 $45.26/pound
$50.43 $8.40/pound
$40.76 $8.15/pound

$262.50 $70.00/gallon
no bid no bid

Cost of the Container Size(s)

Price Per Gallon or Pound

$313.20 $10.44/gallon
$1,140.00 $38.00/gallon
$1,33.33 $44.44/gallon
$523.33 $17.44/gallon
No bid no bid
$600.00 $20.00/gallon
$489.60 $16.32/gallon
$33.89 $13.55/gallon
$23.65 $9.46/gallon
$111.23 $44.49/gallon
$218.75 $87.50/gallon
$95.33 $38.13/gallon
$315.80 $126.32/gallon
No Bid No Bid
$76.81 $38.40/gallon
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$662.50 $265.00/gallon
$76.28 $30.51/gallon
$2,972.80 $1,189.12/gallon
$119.58 $47.83/gallon
no bid no bid
$105.00 $42.00/gallon
$114.48 $45.79/gallon
no bid No Bid
$791.68 $316.67/gallon
$320.00 $128.00/gallon
$1,025.00 $410.00/gallon
$120.00 $48.00/gallon
$806.40 $322.56/gallon
$600.00 $600.00/gallon
$96.00 $96.00/gallon
Discontinued Discontinued
$806.40 $322,56/gallon
$119.00 $119.00/gallon
$87.36 $10.92/gallon
$63.04 $3.94/ounce
$16.80 $2.10/gallon
$210.00 $42.00/1b
$50.43 $8.40/pound
$40.76 $8.15/pound
$262.50 $70.00/gallon
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Cost of the Container Size(s) Price Per Gallon

$6,111.60 $27.78/gallon
$10,375.00 $41.50/gallon
No Bid No Bid
$4,563.00 $16.90/gallon
$2,430.00 $9.00/gallon
No Bid No Bid
$10,375.00 $41.50/gallon
$80,640.00 $322.56/gallon

Cost of the Container Size(s) Price Per Gallon
$27,759.01 $111.04/gallon
$21,116.25 $84.47/gallon
$44,737.50 $178.95/gallon
$23,306.25 $93.23/gallon
$32,362.50 $129.45/gallon
$17,118.75 $68.48/gallon
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$48,437.00

$193.75/gallon

$24,518.50 $98.07/gallon
$41,762.00 $167.05/gallon
$21,181.00 $84.72/gallon
$27,993.87 $111.98/gallon
$22,185.00 588.74/gallon
$31,938.24 $127.75/gallon
$24,496.00 $97.98/gallon
$23,400.99 $93.60/gallon
$18,552.50 $74.21/gallon
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